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On a busy day here at church and nearby, please pray for this afternoon’s
service at Osborne Court Care Home, and the Resettling Communities
Mid-Autumn Festival on the Green. Pray too for Ordinand Katie Fairburn as
she speaks at tonight’s 6.30, and the Students & Young Adults meal after
the service.

John & Poppy are again visiting South Sudan over the next couple of
weeks, on this occasion being joined by Nikki & Jess and Ben. Please pray
for them as they fly to Uganda tomorrow, and during a long taxi journey to
northern Uganda on Monday. Ask that God would protect them and keep
them in good health.

Please pray for the members of our Mission Support Hub who, together
with the various Link Persons for our Mission Partners, do excellent work in
supporting our Partners, sharing news, and encouraging prayer for them.
There is an opportunity to join with them at this evening’s open forum at
the Church Centre.

Please pray for Stacy, our Pre-School & Nursery Manager, and her
dedicated staff team, asking that they will continue to express God’s love,
nurture and care to all the children who attend each day, and also to their
parents. Please pray too for Karen and other members of the PSN
Management Committee.

Please pray for Iain and our hard-working Messy Church team, as this
month’s session takes place after school this afternoon, exploring the
themes of Time & Measurement (from Messy Church Does Science). Pray
too for all those attending this evening’s Alpha taster session.

We are blessed with a dedicated clergy team – Si and Tom, also
supported by Julie. Please continue to uphold them and their wonderfully
supportive family members in prayer, asking that God would grant them
wisdom, strength and compassion, and guide their words and actions as
they lead us in faith.

Laos is listed no 22 on the Open Doors World Watch list. Please pray for
Christians in tribal areas who have lost their homes and been expelled
from their villages for their faith. Ask that God would guide them to safe
places. Open Doors is also our Mission Partner for October, so further
information about its work will be shared at tomorrow’s services.


